ABCTrans

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TO AND FROM SCHOOL

L Bids which do not include an adjustment amount willlnot be accepted.

® The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only

° Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk™

® Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal
purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be
bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTES:
BMO003A/P* S ~ 5 = $ - .=
cEo00oAR* s 2FYem « 299 s BOR s D5H.ev
CHO0002L.2 T $ — $ — $ —
CHO0004L4 $ $ — s

_ =
COLLOOIA/P* ¢ 0 Zﬁﬁ s LOw 373.00
csnaoiar s 4890 ¢ 2,91 o BO.m s 489.00
CSHAOAP & H@Qn ¢ 2/7? ¢ Low ¢ 487.70
csmaoar s 4890 s 299 Bo.w  H8F .

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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CSMMO00IA/P  $__ — s - -
DDO00IESY*  $_ — ¢ _ s -
DLCSMO1* ¢ - s - s - s =
EMO0OIA/P & — ¢ = s - s -
HS0002L2 g  — g - ¢~ g
HS0004L4 £ ° . s = g = ¢ =
HWJROIESY* s A3LMD § 7\)% s Q0.0 A7 0
awpissyr s 239~ ¢ 99 s Boww s 4.0
TR00010A* ¢  — & - ¢ e
JALHO003* s — - s -
JASAO0IESY S - s — : e =
JAENOO2ESY  §_ — ¢ — ¢ — ¢
JFKIHOL c 259, s 97 s Bo.o s ST
LVMI001* c 3370 s 91 s Bo.w s H(F.00
LVKI002 < 3bFow « 297 Bomw s SET o
MEDMO01*  §_ = _ & e =
NRSA001* s - - ¢ - =
OBFFOL $ — S~ $ — S -
RAAAR001 s 5 ¢ _ e _
RDGTO01ESY S - s - T _
SA0001A/P § - g = $ - s -
scMcol s = = S e

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents

Bid Number 2023-10

ABC Trans Corp

for Student Transportation Servicd®.O Box 7804

‘North Brunswick, NJ 08902



— SD0001* s = s - s - ¢
_ SHLIWMI* ¢~ g - s - ¢ -
— SSLCOOIESY* §_ — s = $ e ¢~

PACKAGE
ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2:

HSO0004A/P
HS0001L1

PACKAGE 2
TOTAL

PACKAGE 3:

HS0006A/P
HS0006L6

PACKAGE 3
TOTAL

PACKAGE 13:

HS00026A/P

HS0005L5

PACKAGE 13

TOTAL

PACKAGE 16:

HS0030A/P

HS0003L3

39w s 299 s Bonmn (3.
c 190~ 299 < Bo.n ¢ 190
¢ 58 ¢ 2,97 < /oo s 58[.0
s X900 299 ¢ 8O.» 5?0.09

$ |BY.s0 S/Ovﬁq $ 80.» /84 0

sgﬂ?.m 52/70/ S [ pO.o 557—900
s X0 s 3997 < Bo.m s 389.
(W 1,99 800 (9060

¢ 5990 .91 s [boo 5700
« 3930 ¢ 297 s 8o~ s 393 60
¢ /950 <299 8o s [75.

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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Ségc Trans Corp

.i JBox 7804

North Brunswick, NJ 0890~



PACKAGE 16

TOTAL ¢ 588~ (A AT o /bo.® . 588 .m0

PACKAGE 23:
chooosar  s.39)e s 399 s BOow s U
CHO003L3 s [98.m Z?ﬁ . §0.00 /95 . oo

PACKAGE 23

TOTAL s 5@ s X9)  BOm £ .00

PACKAGE 27:
CHOO011A/P ¢ 392.0 s X 99 ¢ O s 392 .00
CHO0006L6 $ [ 73/.50 $ /2/%7 580-ﬂ> ¢ [/ ?gﬂl

PACKAGE 27

TOTAL ¢« 5&F-o0 c 297 < /b0 ¢ SBF oo

MRIE Hpzpl —NF

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type)

ABC Trans Corp

Company NanP,O Box 7804

North Brunswick, NJ 08902 PH- gUB-2 LY -H2FE

Company Address and Fglephone Number
slglrz

Authorized Sig éﬁatuﬁ U Date

Board of Bducation of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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K n@hféw

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TO AND FROM SCHOOL
® Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
U The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
L Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
® Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal

purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be
bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost

SINGLE ROUTES:
BMO003A/P* S $ 5 s
CEO0009A/P* $ g $ $
CHO0002L2 $ S $ S
CHO0004L4 $ $ $ $
COLLOO1A/P* s $ g s
CSHAO01A/P S $ $ $
CSHAOQ2A/P $ $ $ s
CSHAQ3A/P S $ $ S

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District

Page 33 of 41
Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services

Bid Number 2023-10



CSMMO001A/P  $_376.00 $0.99 $_0.00 $376.00
DDO00IESY*  $.404.00 $0.99 $_65.00 $469.00
DLCSMO1* $ 444.00 $0.99 $_65.00 $509.00
EMO0001A/P $ 421.00 $_0.99 $0.00 $421.00
HS0002L2 $ $ $ $
HS0004L4 $ $ $ $
HWIROIESY*  $.354.00 $0.99 $_65.00 $419.00
HWPJO2ESY*  $.361.00 $0.99 $_65.00 $426.00
IRO0010A* $ $ $ $
JALH003* $ $ $ $
JASAOOIESY $ $ $
JAENOO2ESY ¢ $ $ $
JEKJHO1 $ 351.00 $0.99 $_0.00 $_351.00
LVMI001* $ $ $ $
LVKI002 $ $ S $
MEDMO01* $ $ $ $
NRSA001* $.354.00 $_0.99 $_0.00 $351.00
OBFF01 $.349.00 $_0.99 $_0.00 $349.00
RAAAR00] $426.00 $_0.99 $_0.00 $426.00
RDGTO0IESY  $326.00 $_0.99 $_0.00 $_326.00
SA0001A/P $ 419.00 $_0.99 $_0.00 $ 419.00
SCMCO1 $ 421.00 $ 0.99 $ 0.00 $421.00

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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SD0001* ¢ 439.00 $0.99 $65.00 $.504.00

SHLIWM] * $.442.00 $.0.99 $65.00 $.507.00

SSLCOOIESY* ¢ $ $ S

PACKAGE

ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2;

HS0004A/P $ $ $ S

HS0001L1 $ $ $ $

PACKAGE 2

TOTAL $ $ $ $
PACKAGE 3:

HS0006A/P $ $ $ $

HS0006L6 $ $ $ $

PACKAGE 3

TOTAL 5 $ $ $
PACKAGE 13:

HS00026A/P  § $ $ $

HS0005L5 $ $ $ $

PACKAGE 13

TOTAL 5 S $ 5
PACKAGE 16:

HS0030A/P $ $ $ $

HS0003L3 $ $ $ $

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services
Bid Number 2023-10



PACKAGE 16 :
TOTAL S 5 S S

PACKAGE 23:
CHO006A/P $ 5 S $
CHO0003L3 S S $ S
PACKAGE 23
TOTAL $ $ S 5
PACKAGE 27:
CHOOI1A/P S S $ S
CHO006L6 S $ s 3
PACKAGE 27
TOTAL $ S s S
Marianette Liriano Managing Partner

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type)

Bright Start Transport LLC '

Company Name

491 Neville St Perth Amboy, NJ 08861 ph# 732.925.7376

Company Address and Telephone Number

44;\/ 05/01/2023

Authorized Signature Date

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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Durbam Schwol

Servvew
BID SHEET
;% EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS
STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TO AND FROM SCHOOL
° Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
° The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
° Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk™
L Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal

purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be
bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost

SINGLE ROUTES:
BMO003A/P* NOBID_ ___ $NOBID___  NOBID____  NOBID___
CE0009A/P* $526.35_ S0.01__ $110 $636.35_
CHO0002L.2 NOBID.____ NOBID____  NOBID___  NOBID__
CH0004LA NOBID_____ NOBID_____ NOBID______ NOBID______
COLLOOIA/P* NOBID____ NOBID____ NOBD__  NOBID___
CSHAO1 ¢597.85 _ $001__ S0 $597.85___
CSHAO02 $597.85__ $0.01 S0 §597.85_
CSHAO3 ¢597.85 %001 %0 $597.85_

Board of Bducation of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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= Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services

Bid Number 2023-10



i

CSMMO001A/P

DD0001ESY™*
DLCSMO01*
EMO001A/P
HS0002L2
HS000414

HWIR01ESY*

HWPJO2ESY*
IR00010A*
JALH003*
JASAO01ESY
JAENO02ESY
JEKJHO1
LVMI001*
LVKI002
MEDMO001*
NRSA001*
OBFF01
RAAAR001
RDGTO01ESY

SA0001A/P

SCMCO01

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID_____

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$518.10

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID____

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID_____

$0.01

NO BID

NOBID____

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

0

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID____
NOBID____
NOBID____
NOBID_____
NOBID____
NOBID____
NOBID____
NOBID____
NOBID___
NOBID____
$518.10__
NOBID___
NOBID_____

NO BID

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation

Bid Number 2023-10

Services



SD0001* NOBID_ ___ NOBID___  NOBID____  NOBID___
= SHLIWM1* NOBID_____ NOBID___  NOBID___  NOBID___

SSLCOOIESY* NOBID____  NOBID___  NOBID____ NOBID__

PACKAGE

ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2:

HS0004A/P $29893_  S001___ S0 $298.93__

HS0001L1 $298.93__ $0.01 $0 $298.93_

PACKAGE 2

TOTAL $597.86__ $0.01 $0 $597.86___
PACKAGE 3:

HSO0006A/P $20893__  $001 $0 $298.93_

\ HS0006L6 $298.93__ 5001 S0 $298.93__
PACKAGE 3

TOTAL $597.86__ $0.01 S0 $597.86___
PACKAGE 13:

HS00026A/P ¢29893 %001 %0 $298.93_

HS0005L5 $29893__ $0.01 S0 §298.93___

PACKAGE 13

TOTAL ¢597.86 $001___ SO $597.86_
PACKAGE 16:

HS0030A/P $298.93__ 5001 S0 $298.93___

HS0003L3 $29893  $001__ S0 $298.93_
Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District

— Page 35 of 41

Bid Specifications and Proposa

Bid Number 2023-10

1 Documents for Student Transportation Services



PACKAGE 16

TOTAL $597.86 $0.01 $0 $597.86
PACKAGE 23:

CHO006A/P $298.93 $0.01 $0 $298.93
CHO0003L3 $298.93 $0.01 $0 $298.93
PACKAGE 23

TOTAL $597.86 $001__ $0__ $597.86
PACKAGE 27:

CHO011A/P $298.93 $0.01 $0._ $298.93
CHO0006L6 $298.93 $0.01 $0 $298.93
PACKAGE 27

TOTAL $597.86 $001__ S0 $597.86

William Unverzagt, CFO and Treasurer

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type)

Durham School Services, L.P.

Company Name

2601 Navistar Drive, Lisle, IL 60532 (630) 821-5400

Company Address and Telephone Number
By: Durham Holding Il, L.L.C.,

Z///m//////f// its General Partner 5/4/2023
Authorized/Siogzb/fture Date

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District

— Page 36 of 41
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Lmanile | 1 rans

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TO AND FROM SCHOOL
e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
@ Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk™
e Packages will be awarded on the total, Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal

purposes.

The underqxgned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. 1f awarded the contract, we agree to be
bound to this proposal and the contract ‘documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTES:

CE0009AR* s Q16— s G.oo s [0-" s 336

cooziz s b7 s goo s~ s 6447
CHO0004L4 s Hq."s_ o000 634~
coLooiat  s_AH37 s 0.00 _LaR. "~
csnaoiar s B85 _0.00 €13.~
csHA@AP s B8[€-" s Ooo s T s 8K~

csHAGAP s_ 518~ s @e0 s T s 578~

BMOO3AR* s RTeT s__poo s b0-T s 336.7

O
L

)
£
N

€
h¥23

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services
Bid Number 2023-10



Contel  CSMMO0OIAR a[S/S 0.00

DDO00IESY*

DLCSMO1 *

EMOCO1A/P

H50002L2

H50004L4

() HWIROIESY*

@ HWPJ02ESY*

IR00010A*

O
o
.
~)
Q

)
B R

AL s_3|) T 5o _do— .
aENo2EsY s SB35 ppo s — s 333"
[FKIHOL s 1637 s ps® s — 5|37
w5 3837 5000 s B50 s LR~
L LKIon2 [ ohes s 5(\3 s.o00 s s 3.7

eDMoois 53937 s_poo s \\O.T s G0R.TMece
wesacorr s 17197 s s60 s 337 s Q-

' /)

s@m Il

RDGTOOIESY J é’T/>_o_.Qa_ s — s b~

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public Seheol Diswiet
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Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services

Bid Number 2023-10




SD0001*

SHLIWM]1*

W& —SSLCO0IESY*

PACKAGE
ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2:

HS0004A/P

PACKAGE 2
TOTAL

PACKAGE 3:

HIS0006A/P
HS0006L6

PACKAGE 3
TOTAL.

PACKAGE 13:

HS00026A/P

PACKAGE 13
TOTAL

PACKAGE 16:

HS0030A/P

HS0003L3

R

$

5.

pe

299

b

A L3

i

399"

3lb.—

2997 s

~0.00

i

392"

R

AL

A

_715.7 ¢ _p.oo s s _JIS-"
299.7 s_g.0d s s 299.
RI6T s poo s s Jlb.—

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School Distriet
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Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services
Bid Number 2023-10



PACKAGE 16

— —
TOTAL S 7/5-' $_L-00 $ - s _7/S'¢
PACKAGE 23: |

chooosa? s 3497 s 0.00 s s AT
crooss s 3UbTs gm0 s s_ 3%
PACKAGE 23 _ _
TOTAL s JYS.T s p.oo s s |HS-
PACKAGE 27:

choona?  s__ 399" s_p.wo s s 3997
CHO0006L6 s 3\b.7 s p.oo s 5 3[b.”
PACKAGE 27 L _
TOTAL s US.” 50,00 3 s 7S5

_ SamirBestwnos [pay,
Authorized Bidder’s Name and Titlé—(Print or Type)

$] // ﬁ
C N ’ . j - e
oropany Rame 4 Cornwall Dr, Suite 109
East Brunswick, NJ 08816
Company Address and Telephone Number
e ez, QAR
Authorized Signature Datb

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District -
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Tver snpenN T

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TO AND FROM SCHOOL
° Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
° The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
® Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
® Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal

purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
dav of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be
bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTES:
549.00 131.00 680.00
BMOOO3A/P* & g 100 s $
CE0009A/P* ¢ 549.00 $ 1.00 8 131.00 ¢ 680.00
549.00 .
—— g 500 100 ¢ 13100 ¢ 68000
— , 5900 o 100 ¢ 13100 ¢ 68000
COLLO0IA/P*  § N/B S S $
N/B
CSHAO1A/P S S $ S
CSHAOQ02A/P S B S S $
CSHAO3AP  §_ N8 $ $ $

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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Bid Number 2023-10



N/B

CSMMOO00IA/P  § $ s ¢
DDOOOIESY* & "B ¢ ¢ ¢
pLesmorr ¢ s s s
N/B
EMO0OIAR § $ ¢
HS0002L2 ¢ 54800 g 100 g 131.00 4  680.00
HS0004L4 ¢ 54900 ¢  1.00 s 13100 o 68000
HWIROIESY* ¢ B $ $ ¢
N/B
HWPJO2ESY* $ $ ¢
TRO0010A* g 54900 4 100 ¢ 13100 ¢ 68000
JALH003* g B s s s
JASAO0IESY  s_ VB $ $ $
N/B
JAENOO2ESY § $ ¢
JFKJHOL g ME g :
LVMI001* g NE $ ¢ ¢
N/B
LVKI002 $ § $ ¢
MEDMOOT* & VB s $ ¢
NRSA001* g NB $ $ ¢
OBFF01 g NB % S 5
RAAAROOL  $__ "0 s s :
B
RDGTO0IESY NB $ g
SA0001A/P g_ NB $ $ S
SCMCO1 s NB $ s s

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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Bid Number 2023-10

osal Documents for Student Transportation Services



N/B

SD0001* $ $ $ $
N/B
SHLIWMI* $ $ ¢ ¢
N/B
SSLCOO1ESY* $ $ $ 8
PACKAGE
ROUTES:
PACKAGE 2:
449.00
HS0004A/P $ ¢ 100 ¢ 50.00 g 499.00
HS0001L1 ¢ 100.00 ¢ 1.00 g 2000 ¢  150.00
PACKAGE 2
TOTAL g 54900 o 100 g  100.00 649.00
PACKAGE 3:
HS0006A/P g 44900 100 ¢ 50.00 g 499.00
100.00 1.00 50.00 150.00
HS0006L6 $
PACKAGE 3 549.00 1.00 100.00 649.00
TOTAL $
PACKAGE 13:
HS00026A/P g 44900 g 100 g 5000 g 499.00
100.00 1.00 50.00 50.0
HS0005L5 000 0 150.00
PACKAGE 13
TOTAL g 54900 1.00 g 100.00 g 04900
PACKAGE 16:
HS0030A/P ¢ 449.00 ¢ 100 ¢ 50.00 ¢ 499.00
HS0003L3 ¢ 100.00 ¢ 1.00 ¢ 50.00 ¢ 150.00

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District

Page 35 of 41

Bid Specifications and Pro

Bid Number 2023-10

posal Documents for Student Transportation Services



PACKAGE 16

TOTAL $ 549.00 ¢ 1.00 $ 100.00 ¢ 649.00
PACKAGE 23:
CHO006A/P ¢ 44900 ¢ 100 ¢ 5000 ¢ 499.00
CHO0003L3 S 100.00 8 1.00 g 50.00 8 150.00
%églzLAGE 23 S 549.00 $ 1.00 ¢ 100.00 $ 649.00
PACKAGE 27:
CHOO11A/P ¢ 449.00 ¢ 1.00 ¢ 50.00 5499.00
CHO006L6 $ 100.00 8 1.00 $ 50.00 $ 150.00
gﬁgI:LAGE 27 $ 549.00 $ 1.00 ¢ 100.00 ¢ 649.00
DOROTHY BRANDT LOCATION MANAGER
Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type)
FIRST STUDENT INC.
Company Name
145 AMBOY ROAD MORGANVILLE, N.J. 07751 732-536-3485
Compan, ress and Telephon
5/8/2023
A]ﬁ%nzed Date

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
Page 36 of 41
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BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TO AND FROM SCHOOL

U Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.

o The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only

o Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*

® Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal
purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be
bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTES:

BMO0003A/P* sﬁi@/ 00 SLQ/F/, ) $ _/0 0. ISR 6 7/ Qo
CE0009A/P* s5 9('),/1,7@ $ Q7 S $ (00, 0o $ A'gc%&()

CHO0002L2 $ $ $ $
CHO0004L4 $ $ $ $
COLLOO1A/P* <,[> Sg O SQJ S g / / (), 00 5766 eV
CSHAOIA/P $ $ $ $
CSHAO02A/P $ $ $ $
CSHAO3AP $ $ $

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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Bid Number 2023-10



csmmonoiar sdloo s 5 7S s N () s AJLA)
DDO001ESY* S S S S
DLCSMOI* s s s
oo sA88 00 sl 7S s AdA s AP
HSO002L2  § $ s s
HS0004L4 s s $
HWIR01ESY* S S S 2
HWPJ02ESY* S S S S
IRO00I0A* s s s
JALHOO3* s s s
JASAQOIESY S S 5 $
JAENOO2ESY S S $ $
JEKJHOL s 3K 00 sA1S s JMA s MY
LVMIOOI*  § s $ $
LVKI002 s s s s
MEDMO0]1* S S S $
NRSAQOI* s s $

OBFFOI [Spe TS s MA s A
ramaR00l s Heo sRTS s NA s NIA
rooTooiEsY s/ Bloo sRT1S AN AMA
saooar s oo s 27C s NIA s ND
SCMCO1 52g/(¢ sQ‘7,( $ /(//,4 $ /l//;g

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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SD0001* 2 S 5 S

SHLIWMI* S $ $ $

SSLCOOIESY* S 5 $ s

PACKAGE

ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2:

HSO0004A/P S 5 $ S

HSO0001L1 S S S S

PACKAGE 2

TOTAL s s S $
PACKAGE 3:

HS0006A/P S $ 8 $

HS0006L6 S S S s

PACKAGE 3

TOTAL g 8 s $
PACKAGE 13:

HS00026A/P S S $ S

HSO0005L5 S $ $ $

PACKAGE 13

TOTAL $ s S $
PACKAGE 16:

HSO0030A/P S S s s

HS0003L3 S S $ $

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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PACKAGE 16

TOTAL 5 3 s 5
PACKAGE 23:

CHOO006A/P S $ $ $

CHO0003L3 $ $ $ $

PACKAGE 23

TOTAL s S 5 S
PACKAGE 27:

CHOO11A/P S S S $

CHO006L6 S 5 3 S

PACKAGE 27

TOTAL $ $ S S

/’/CW g Goberr/ A / A0l

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or T}@

Hap) Coomep

Company Narne

138 Svmn? nt{ £ Gokiwd M oggss Lol ST 77

Company Address, and Telephone Nunqlbe}‘ J ‘ -
(AT 0425/
Authorized Signature” " Date

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District

Page 36 of 41
Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services

Bid Number 2023-10



KD Busbervicq

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TO AND FROM SCHOOL
® Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
° The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
o Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk™*
o Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal

purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be
bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route | Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost

SINGLE ROUTES:
BMO0003A/P* $ $ 5 s
CE0009A/P* $_419.00 $_0.99 $_75.00 $.494.00
CHO0002L.2 $ . S $ s
CHOYOO4L4 $ $ $ $
COLLO01A/P*  $419.00 ¢ 0.99 $ 85.00 $ 504 00
CSHAOQ1A/P $ $ S $
CSHA02A/P $ $ $ S
CSHAOQ3A/P $ S ] $

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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CSMMO001A/P  $295.00 $__0.99 $_20.00 $295 00
DDO001ESY*  $_245.00 $_04g $_50.00 $_295.00
DLCSMO1* $ $ 5 $
EMO00IA/P $ $ $
HS00021.2 $ $ $ $
HS0004L4 $ $ $ $
HWJIR01ESY* ¢ 275.00 $ 099 $ 55.00 $_330.00
HWPJO2ESY*  $ $ $ $
IR00010A* $ $ $ $
JALH003* $ $ $ $
JASAQOIESY  § $ $ $
JAENO02ESY  $ $ $ $
JFKJHO1 $_309.00 $.0,99 $_20 $_309.00
LVMI001* 3 s s s
LVKI002 $ $ $ $
MEDMO001* $_405.00 $__0.99 ¢_ 82.00 $_487.00
NRSA001* $205.00 $_0.99 $_66.00 ¢ 271.00
OBFF01L $_274.00 $_0.99 $_20 $_274.00
RAAAR001 $.321.00 $_0.99 $_ 20 $_321.00
RDGTO001ESY  $_245.00 $_0.99 $__ 20 $_ 245.00
SA0001A/P $_376 00 $_0.99 $_20 $__376.00
SCMCO01 $_345.00 $__0.99 $__20 $_ 345.00

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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1 Documents for Student Transportation Services



SD0001* $_302.00 $_0.99 $_55.00 $_357.00

SHLIWM1* $ $ $ S

SSLCOOIESY* $_ 21000 S 099 $_172 $_291.00

PACKAGE

ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2:

HS0004A/P S S $ -

HS0001L1 S S $ $

PACKAGE 2

TOTAL $ S B S
PACKAGE 3:

HSO0006A/P S S S 5

HS0006L6 S S $ $

PACKAGE 3

TOTAL $ $ o S
PACKAGE 13:

HS00026A/P  $ $ $ g

HS0005L5 g $ $ ¢

PACKAGE 13

TOTAL $ $ $ s
PACKAGE 16:

HS0030A/P. S S $ $
HS0003L3 S S $ $

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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PACKAGE 16

TOTAL 5 $ $ s
PACKAGE 23:

CHO006A/P § S $ S

CHO0003L3 $ 5 § $

PACKAGE 23

TOTAL $ $ $ s
PACKAGE 27:

CHOO11A/P $ $ s s

CHO0006L6 s $ $ $

PACKAGE 27

TOTAL S S S $

Fidelina Estevez_ MANAGER

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type)

K&D BUS SERVICE LLC

Company Name

11 main st Somerset, NJ 08873, 347 210 7374

Company Address and Telephone Number

S 'y s o

05/09/2023

(L
5 Date

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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K&’D Trans

BID SHEET
EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TO AND FROM SCHOOL
® Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
® The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
o Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk™
L Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal

purposes.

The undersigned hereby subinits the following bid(s) to trauispoit pupils duriig the 2023-2024 schiool
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first

day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be

bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost

SINGLE RCUTES:
BMO003A/P* S $ $ S
CE0009A/P* $ $ S $
CHO0002L.2 S $ $ S
CHO0004L4 $ $ S $
COLLOOIA/P*  § s S $
CSHAOQ1A/P $ $ 5 $
CSHAOQ2A/P $ S $ $
CSHAO03A/P $ $ 5 S

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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CSMMO001AP  $_2 74 s 1 lmlle s/ s 274
DDO00IBSY*  $ $ $ $
DLCSMOL*  $_2/9 s Llucle s Qo _ 299
EMO001A/P $ a0 $_ g lE S / $_S0a
HS0002L.2 $ $ $ s
HS0004L4 $ $ $ $
HWJROIESY*  $ S_ $ $
HWPJO2ESY*  $ $ $ $
IR00010A* $ $ $ $
JALH003* $ $ $ $
JASAOOIESY  § $ $ $
JAENOO2ESY  § $ $ $

JFKJHOL s 2499 s dsule s [/ 5299
LVMJ001* $ $ $ $

LVKI002 s S $ $
MEDMO01* $ $ $ $
NRSA001* s_[Qo S Llmle $_ 59 s 239
OBFF01 s 284 s 1)ale s/ s 289
RAAAROOL  $_3/5 % e s/ s /5
RDGT001ESY ¢ $ $ $
SAO001A/P $ $ $ $

SCMC01 s s S <

Board of Education of the Towunship of East Brunswick Public School District
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SD0001* S $ 5 S

SHLIWM] * $ $ $ $
SSLCOOIESY* $ $ $
PACKAGE

ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2:

HS0004A/P $ $ $ $
HS0001L1 $ $ $ s
PACKAGE 2

TOTAL % $ S $
PACKAGE 3:

HS0006A/P $ $ $ $
HS0006L6 $ $ $ $
PACKAGE 3

TOTAL $ 5 5 2

PACKAGE 13:

HS00026A/P $ $ $ $

HS0005L5 $ $ $ 5

PACKAGE 13

TOTAL  § $ $ $
PACKAGE 16:

HS0030A/P $ $ $ 8

HS0003L3 $ $ $ 5

Board of Education of the Township of East Biunswick Public School District
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PACKAGEK 16

TOTAL % S S $
PACKAGE 23:
CHOO06A/P S S S S
CHO0003L3 g $ $ $
PACKAGE 23
TOTAL $ S g $
PACKAGE 27:
CHOO11A/P S S $ S
CHO0006L6 $ $ $ $
PACKAGE 27
TOTAL S 2 S $
Mg Wekha') [pvana e )
Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type)
Kero transt L C
Company Name

2T ulsn 28 2uete, E8T hrupsad) I AUT €55/

Company Address’and Telephone Number

a el b 2T 23

Authorized Signafure—— Date

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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Mercy Transportation Inc.

13 Major Rd,
Monmouth Junction, NJ 08852 BID SHEET
EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS
STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TO AND FROM SCHOOL
U Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
° The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
° Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk™®
° Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal
purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be
bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTES:
BMO0003A/P* $_397.00 $_2.00 $.95.00 $.492.00
CEQ009A/P* $_397.00 $.2.00 $95.00 $_492.00
CH0002L.2 S $ $ 5
CHO0004L4 s s s S
COLLO01A/P*  $520.00 $_2.00 $.95.00 $_615.00
CSHAO1A/P $.397.00 $.2.00 $_0.00 $.397.00
CSHAQ2A/P $.397.00 $2.00 $_0.00 $.397.00
CSHAO03A/P $.397.00 5.2.00 $__0.00 $_397.00

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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" 13 Major Rd,
snmouth Junction, NJ 08852

CSMMO001A/P  § $ s $
DDO0001ESY* $ $ s $
DLCSMO01* $ $ s s
EMO0001A/P $ s s S
HS0002L.2 $ $ s s
HS0004L4 $ $ $ s
HWIROIESY* § ® $ S
HWPJO2ESY*  § $ $ S
IR00010A* $ $ $ $
JALHO003* $_595.00 $_2.00 $.95.00 $.690.00
JASAQ01ESY $_595.00 $_2.00 $__0.00 $.595.00
JAENOO2ESY  § $ $ s
JEKJHOL $ $ s $
LVMJI001* $_585.00 $_2.00 $.95.00 $_680.00
LVKI002 s s s 5
MEDMO001* $_535.00 $_2.00 $.95.00 $_630.00
NRSA001* $ $ $ $
OBFF01 s $ s $
RAAARO001 $ S s S
RDGTO01ESY $ $ $ S
SA0001A/P § 8 S s
SCMCO01 s $ s S

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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Mercy"‘TEahsportatiOn Inc.

13 Major Rd,
Monmouth Junction, NJ 08852
' SD0001* $ $ $ $
SHLIWMI1* 5 $ $ $
SSLCOOIESY*  § 5 $ $
PACKAGE
ROUTES:
PACKAGE 2:
HS0004A/P $_440.00 $_1.00 $_0.00 $_440.00
HS0001L1 $__80.00 $_1.00 $_0.00 $_80.00
PACKAGE 2
TOTAL $_520.00 $_2.00 $_000 $520.00
PACKAGE 3:
HS0006A/P $_440.00 $_1.00 $_0.00 $.440.00
HS0006L6 $__80.00 $_1.00 $_0.00 $__80.00
PACKAGE 3
TOTAL $_520.00 $_2.00 $_0.00 $_520.00
PACKAGE 13:
HS00026A/P $_440.00 $.1.00 $.0.00 $_440.00
HS0005L5 S__80.00 $.1.00 $.0.00 $__80.00
PACKAGE 13
TOTAL $_520.00 $.2.00 $_0.00 $_ 520.00
PACKAGE 16:
HS0030A/P $_440.00 $_1.00 $_0.00 $_440.00
HS0003L3 $_80.00 $_1.00 $_0.00 $__80.00

Board of Bducation of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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vVicivy e R

13 Major Rd,
Monmouth Junction, NJ 08852

PACKAGE 16
TOTAL $.520.00 $.2.00 $_0.00 $_520.00
PACKAGE 23:
CHO006A/P $ 455.00 $ 1.00 $ 000 ¢ 455.00
CHO003L3 $__80.00 $_1.00 $_000 $__80.00
PACKAGE 23
TOTAL % 535.00 $_2.00 $_0.00 $_535.00
PACKAGE 27:
CHOO11A/P $_455.00 $_1.00 $_0.00 $_455.00
CHO0006L6 $__80.00 $1.00 $_000 $__80.00
PACKAGE 27
TOTAL $_535.00 $_2.00 $_0.00 $_ 535.00
Sayed |brahim, President/CEQO
‘Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type)
Mercy Transportation Inc.
Company Name
13 Major Rd, Monmouth Junction 8852
Company Address and Telephon jl}gffber
! 05/08/2023
Authorized Signature =~~~ Date

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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Nuteight=

Tvangpurtashay]

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TO AND FROM SCHOOL
° Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
® The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
® Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
® Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal

purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first

day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be

bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost

SINGLE ROUTES:
BMO0003A/P* S | $ $ $
CEO0009A/P* 5 S s $
CHO0002L2 $ $ $ $
CHO0004L4 S $ S $
COLLOOIA/P*  § 5 $ $
CSHAOIAP  $___ s s $
CSHAOQ2A/P $ $ S $
CSHAOQ3A/P S S S S

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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CSMMO00IA/P $_ 3QO ¢ .80 ¢ 5O ¢ 350
DDO00IESY* $_ 230 s .60 s /o0 ¢ 580

DLoSMOLY s 275 s .80 ¢ /OO ¢ 373
EMO00IA? s BJRQ s 80 s 4O s B7A

HS0002L.2 $ $ $ $

HS0004L4 $ $ $ $
HWIROIESY* $_ 288 .50 s )OO ¢ Yas
HWPI2ESY* s 284S ¢ 50 ¢ /OO0 a5

TRO0010A* $ $ $ ¢
JALH003* 8 $ ¢ ¢
JASAOQO1ESY S S 5 S
JAENOO2ESY S $ S S
JEKJHOL « B/)S .50 s po s 3?3
LVMJO001* S S S $
LVK1002 s s s s
MEDMO001* S S S S

NRSA001* ¢ NS s .50 ¢ JoO s 3BIS

OBFF01 ¢ Q50 s .60 s BJ s 2385

RAAAR00] s 375 ¢ B0 s 50 ¢ Y25

RDGTO0IESY ¢ 265 ¢ 80O s 50 s 3/
SA0001A/P ¢ 2o .50 s S50 s Y10
SCMCO1 s 270 ¢.S0 ¢ 50 ¢ Y20

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District

Page 34 of 41
Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services

Bid Number 2023-10



SD0001* s %3S ¢ .80 s 10O ¢ 435

SHLIWMI * 8 3/s ¢ 5 ¢ [00 ¢ Y/5

SSLCOOIESY* s 3AS ¢+ 50 ¢ loo ¢ Ya5

PACKAGE

ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2:

HS0004A/P § $ $ $

HS0001L1 $ $ $ $

PACKAGE 2

TOTAL $ $ $ $
PACKAGE 3:

HS0006A/P $ $ $ $

HS0006L6 $ $ $ $

PACKAGE 3

TOTAL $ $ $ S
PACKAGE 13:

HS00026A/P  § $ $ $

HS0005L5 $ $ $ $

PACKAGE 13

TOTAL $ $ $ $
PACKAGE 16:

HS0030A/P $ $ $ $
HS0003L3 $ $ $ $

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick: Public School District
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PACKAGE 16

TOTAL s $ $ $
PACKAGE 23:

CHO006A/P $ $ S S

CHO0003L3 S ] S s

PACKAGE 23

TOTAL $ 5 $ $
PACKAGE 27:

CHOO011A/P S $ $ $

CHO0006L6 9 $ s s

PACKAGE 27

TOTAL S $ S s

Ellane Boebas Pessidernt

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type)

Nv Reighds Te anspoe rodon

Company Name~

29 Magion Dog, Spinadiedd, N 0203

Company Address and Telephone Number —

%M@@ém $/3)23
Authotized Signature Date

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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[oors TRAN sporia

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TO AND FROM SCHOOL
J Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
J The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
° Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk™*
° Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal

purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be
bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTES:

BMO003A/P* S $ S S

cEooooapr sG-S 5[99 s e s S

CHO0002L.2 S $ S S
CH0004L4 S $ S S
COLLOO1A/P* & $ $ s
CSHAO1A/P S $ S , $
CSHA02A/P S $ = $
CSHAOQ3A/P $ $ $ S

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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CSMMOOOIA/P  $ /X \Rb\“’f/s 199 s (0.0 59\2L,| 09
DDO00IESY* s_gflf-% s 199 ¢ G;L!L“ 5@5&3—
presmor* s 2R s JA ¢ 119 s 46000
eooar s ZRYE s AR s 0.8 s 32§
HS0002L2 s s s s

HS0004L4 s s s s
mwrosy: s Q44 s .99 5 91> s 390
pweiBsy* s SA4SS s 109 s8G % s 43a
moootoar s LAVE s 189 s L0 s SCo=
JALHO003* s s $ s
JASAQ0IESY S $ $ $
JAENOO02ESY S S $ $

JFKIHO1 s s s s

LVMJ001* $ s ¢ ¢

LVKI002 BARE 13 s o= sSh
vEDMoolr  s522% ¢ 199 ¢ Q2 s @0t
NRSAQ01* s ¢ s ¢

OBFFOL IR AN g aLee $ZSRET
RAAAROOL s s ;
RDGTO0IESY ~ § 2h\§>$ \lC\CL s oot s G S
SAO00IAP ¢ $ s ¢

SCMCO1 5 $ $ $

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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SD0001* $ $ s s

SHLIWMI* S 5 S $

SSLCOOIESY* § $ s s

PACKAGE

ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2:

HS0004A/P S $ S s

HS0001L1 $ $ S $

PACKAGE 2

TOTAL $ $ s s
PACKAGE 3:

HS0006A/P s 5 5 5

HS0006L6 S $ $ 5

PACKAGE 3

TOTAL $ s $ S
PACKAGE 13:

HS00026A/P S 5 $ ' s

HS0005L5 S $ 5 S

PACKAGE 13

TOTAL s $ s S
PACKAGE 16:

HS0030A/P $ S s s

HS0003L3 $ 5 B S

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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PACKAGE 16

TOTAL s $ s $
PACKAGE 23:

CHO0006A/P $ 5 $ S

CHO0003L3 S $ $ $

PACKAGE 23

TOTAL 5 $ s $
PACKAGE 27:

CHO011A/P S $ $ S

CHO0006L6 S S S s

PACKAGE 27

TOTAL $ $ s $

MY
onze dder s Name and Tltle (Print or Type)
N
@C ] Q

Company Name
b @am@ mskm S T e22ic

mpany Add&e\ss}nd Telephone Numb \S
\ — ‘ o5lclle=,

ignature Date |

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District

Page 36 of 41
Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services

Bid Number 2023-10



AT Tytvhs

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TO AND FROM SCHOOL
U Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
o The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
® Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
° Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal

purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be
bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost

SINGLE ROUTES:
BMO0003A/P* S $ 5 $
CEQ009A/P* $ $ $ $
CHO0002L2 S $ S S
CHO0004L4 $ $ $ $
COLLOO1A/P*  $ $ g s
CSHAO1A/P $ s $ s
CSHAO02A/P $ g $ S
CSHAOQ3A/P g S s $

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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CSMMO001A/P  $ $ 5 $

DDO00IESY*  § $ $ $

DLCSMO1* s 309.00 s 0.93 ¢\ 0.00 s 39900
EMO00IA/P  § $ $ $

HS0002L2 $ $ $ $

HS0004L4 $ $ $ $
HWIROIESY* & $ $ $
HWPJO2ESY*  § $ $ $

IR00010A* $ $ $ $

JALH003* s 4 51.00 s\ 50 s 10.00 s b2\.00
JASAQOIESY  § $ $ $
JAENOO2ESY  $ s $ $

JFKJHO1 $ $ & 9

LVMJ001* $ $ $ $

LVKI002 $ g $ 5

MEDMO001* $ $ $ $

NRSA001* $ $ $ $

OBFF01 $ $ $ $

RAAAR001 $ $ $ $
RDGTO0IESY  $ $ $ $

SA0001A/P $ $ $ $

SCMCO01 s 2 3H.pos 0dQ s NIA 2 AW, 060

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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SD0001* $2q5.oos 2.-99 s 005 3T hH-00

SHLIWM]1* $ $ $ 8

SSLCO0I1ESY* $ $ $ $

PACKAGE

ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2:

HS0004A/P $ $ $ $

HS0001L1 $ $ $ $

PACKAGE 2

TOTAL $ $ $ S
PACKAGE 3:

HS0006A/P $ $ $ $

HS0006L6 $ $ $ $

PACKAGE 3

TOTAL $ $ $ $
PACKAGE 13:

HS00026A/P $ $ $ $

HS0005L5 $ $ $ $

PACKAGE 13

TOTAL $ $ $ $
PACKAGE 16:

HS0030A/P $ $ $ $

HS0003L3 $ $ $ $

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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PACKAGE 16

TOTAL S S S S
PACKAGE 23:
CHO006A/P $ $ $ $
CHO0003L3 $ $ $ $
PACKAGE 23
TOTAL S S S $
PACKAGE 27:
CHO0011A/P $ $ $ $
CHO0006L6 $ $ $ $
PACKAGE 27
TOTAL S S S S
Scaad Vabdin 3 »resielevd_

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type)
8& T Tvans\\C

Company Name

39 Koster D\ud Rt ££18 FdiSon, N 1. 0837 132318 ATH6

Company Address and Telephone Number

- o\ M oy 09 ! ,‘2@ 23
~—Authorized Signatire o Date
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ASUNSET TRAINS.

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TO AND FROM SCHOOL
U Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
® The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
® Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
® Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal

purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be
bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost

SINGLE ROUTES:
BMOQ03A/P* S S $ s
CE0Q009A/P* $.450.00 $_ 8.00 $_ 46.00 $_496.00
CHO0002L2 $ S $ S
CHO0004L4 S $ s s
COLLO001A/P*  $_450.00 $__8.00 $__46.00 $_496.00
CSHAO1A/P $ $ s $
CSHA02A/P S 3 $ s
CSHAO03A/P $ $ $ 5

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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CSMMO0001A/P  $_366.00 $_8.00 46.00 412.00
DDO00IESY* S $
DLCSMO01* $_390.00 $_8.00 46.00 436.00
EMO001A/P S $
HS0002L2 S $
HS0004L4 S s
HWIROIESY*  $_390.00 $_8.00 46.00 445.00
HWPJ02ESY*  $_410.00 $_800 4600 456.00
IROO010A* 5 S
JALHO03* $_522.00 $_8.00 46.00 568.00
JASAO001ESY $ S
JAENOO02ESY S $
JFKJHO1 $_399.00 $_8.00 46.00 445.00
LVYMIO001* $_444.00 $_8.00 46.00 490.00
LVKI002 $_488.00 $_800 4600 534.00
MEDMO001* g 5
NRSA001* S $
OBFFO01 S $
RAAARO001 5 $
RDGTO0IESY S S
SAQ001A/P 5 $
SCMCO01 s S

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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SD000]1* S S S s

SHLIWMI* $ s S S

SSLCO0IESY*  § $ 5 S

PACKAGE

ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2:

HSO0004A/P S S 5 $

HS0001L1 g ; S S s

PACKAGE 2

TOTAL S s s $
PACKAGE 3:

HS0006A/P $ $ $ $

HS0006L6 s $ S $

PACKAGE 3

TOTAL s s s s
PACKAGE 13:

HS00026A/P S 8 § $

HS0005L.5 S S S g

PACKAGE 13

TOTAL s s s s
PACKAGE 16:

HSO0030A/P S S S s
HS0003L.3 S 5 S S

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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PACKAGE 16

TOTAL $ $ $ S
PACKAGE 23:

CHOO006A/P S $ $ S

CHO00031.3 S g $ s

PACKAGE 23

TOTAL s S s 5
PACKAGE 27:

CHOO11A/P $ $ s s

CHO0006L.6 S S s s

PACKAGE 27

TOTAL s S _ s $

Mohamed A Eltayeb /// Manager

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type)

Sunset Transportation LLC

Company Name

254 Pinelli Dr, Piscataway, NJ 08854

Company Address and Telephone Number

== 5/9/2023

Authorized Signature Date
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TAke Tyme
BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TO AND FROM SCHOOL
° Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
L The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
° Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk™
° Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal

purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be
bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTES:

BMOO03A/P* S $ S -

CE0009A/P* S S $ $

CHO0002L2 S $ $ S

CHO0004L4 S $ $ S

COLLO0IARP* s HHB s 1.5 77500 $520:00

CSHAO1A/P S S $ S
CSHAO02A/P $ S $ 5
CSHAOQ3A/P S $ 5 s

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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CSMMO000IAR ¢ DD ¢ [+50 15. 00 53‘{3@0/55[000
pDoooiESY*  $ D00 s |- B0 s [DBwo $3F5.00
prosmorr ¢ 1D s 50 ¢ TJ5 0D ¢ /j50.00
EMO001A/P s 300 s 150 s [Boo ¢ 30000

HS0002L.2 S S $ S

N

HS0004L4 s s $ s
HwiRolESY* s DHB 5 )50 ¢ 1500 s 14000
HWPIO2ESY* ¢ AUD s [« SO0 ¢ 1500 ¢ Hoo-oo

IR00010A* S S S S
JALH003* s s ; 6
JASAQ01ESY S $ $ $
JAENO02ESY S S S S
JFKJHO1 s A5 |50 s _]500D s3’5/590
LVMJO01* S S S S
LVKI002 $ s s s

mepmool* s 4B ¢ ['SO ¢ T]5:00 53000
NRSA001* s 200 ¢ 'S s 750D ¢ DIH00

OBFF01 S $ ] s

RAAAROQ01 S $ $ S

RDGTOIESY ~ $.50D s 150 s 1500 5300/5?5

SA0001A/P $ $ S ¢

SCMCO1 $ ¢ S ¢

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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SD0001* S S 5 $

SHLIWMI*  $ $ s $

ssLcooiesy* s HTH ¢ 18D ¢ 5.0 « BbD-5D

PACKAGE

ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2:

HS0004A/P S $ $ S

HS0001L1 ¢ ¢ ¢ ¢

PACKAGE 2

TOTAL $ $ $ $
PACKAGE 3:

HS0006A/P $ $ $ $

HS0006L6 $ $ $ $

PACKAGE 3

TOTAL S $ $ $
PACKAGE 13:

HS00026A/P $ S $

HS0005L5 $ $ $ $

PACKAGE 13

TOTAL S 5 S 5
PACKAGE 16:

HS0030A/P $ $ $ 8

HS0003L3 ¢ ¢ $ ¢
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PACKAGE 16

TOTAL s 5 $ $
PACKAGE 23:

CHOO006A/P $ $ $ .3

CHO0003L3 $ % $ 8

PACKAGE 23

TOTAL S s S s
PACKAGE 27:

CHOO11A/P S $ $ $

CHO0006L6 $ ] s S

PACKAGE 27

TOTAL 5 $ $ s

%{nsma/@ G?M/(i Otimor

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type)

Towy Mz Juyme [/C
Company/Name /

o BQWBBS(@,M ot M 0i61s 732353 7130

Comp dress and Telephone Number

At/ e— \q/g/zazs

Authorized Signature

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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Tz Broses

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TO AND FROM SCHOOL
® Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
® The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
® Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
® Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal

purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be
bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTES:
BMO0003A/P* $ $ $ s
CEQ009A/pP* S $ $ 5
CH0002L2 S g $ 5
CHO0004L4 S 5 $ oS
COLLOO1A/P*  § $ $ s
CSHAOIA/P S s $ S
CSHA02A/P $ 5 5 S

CSHAOQ3A/P S 5 s S




CSMMOO00IAP  $ s

DDO0OIESY* s

DLCSMOI* $

EMO00IA® 242 s 1.99 A/ A ChE
HS0002L2 9 $

HS00041.4 s S

HWIROIESY*  § s

HWPI2ESY*  s_ AR s #6949 28, <378
IR00010A* s s

JALHO3* s S04 s 499 7o oL
asa0IEsY s 2% 94 s .99 s_y/4 LR
JAENOO2ESY § 324 s, 49 _ WA e
JFKIHOL s 23 s .99 s A 24
oo s 304 s 99 /%) Y2
LVKI002 299 s 99 s A s 299
MEDMOO1*  § s

NRSA001* $ $

OBFF0] s 288 s .99 s M s 25K
RAAAROO]  § s

rocrooiesy s AK s .99 /{//Z[L 4Z
SAQ001A/P s s

SCMCO1 $ $




SD0001*

SHLIWMI*

SSLCO01ESY*

9

Ve

PACKAGE
ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2:
HS0004A/P
HS0001L1

PACKAGE 2
TOTAL

PACKAGE 3:
HS0006A/P
HS0006L6

PACKAGE 3
TOTAL

PACKAGE 13:

HS00026A/P

HS0005L5

PACKAGE 13
TOTAL

PACKAGE 16:

HS0030A/P

HS0003L3




PACKAGE 16

TOTAL s s S $
PACKAGE 23:

CHO006A/P S 5 s S

CHO0003L3 S $ S s

PACKAGE 23

TOTAL $ $ s s
PACKAGE 27:

CHO011A/P S $ S s

CHO0006L6 8 $ s 8

PACKAGE 27

TOTAL S S $ $

AT A MSY

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type)

//mwpﬂﬂﬁﬁwﬁ

Cdmpany Name

w/ Y s Ave st c/( eSS f/ﬁ#ﬁ%ﬁg
Company deress and Telephone Number
%/5/&@

/;@mw Signature "Date




TRI0 TRANS

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT PUPIL TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TO AND FROM SCHOOL
° Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
° The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
® Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk™
° Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal

purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be

bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. >
Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTES:
BMO0003A/P* $ $ 5 5
CE0009A/P* S S S s
CHO00021.2 $ $ $ $
CHO00041.4 $ S S $
COLLO01A/P* & S $ $
CSHAOQ1A/P S $ s $
CSHAOQ02A/P $ s S $
CSHAQ3A/P S s $ g
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CSMMO001A/P  § S S $
DDO0001ESY* S s S $
DLCSMO1* S S S 5
EMOOOIA/R  § s $ $
HS0002L2 $ s $ $
HS0004LA4 S S S $
HWJROIESY* S S S s
HWPJO2ESY*  § 3 s $
TR00010A* $ $ § $
JALH003* $ $ $ $
JASAOOIESY  § g $ $
JAENO02ESY S $ $ $
JFKJHO1 $ $ s $
LVMI001* $ $ 8 $
LVKI002 $ $ s s
MEDMOO01*  § $ 8 ¢
NRSA001* $ $ $ $
OBFF01 $ $ $ $
RAAAROL  § 202 $_o0.%n  $_n] g DHm
RDGTO01ESY S $ $ $
SAQ0OIAR 3 $ $ $
ScMcol $ $ s $
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SD0001* s 254 $ .00 s_ W s_ 20K
SHLIWMI*  § s s s
SSLOOOIESY* § 270, $a.88  S_aa  $ 2%3
PACKAGE

ROUTES:

PACKAGE 2:

HSO004A/P s s s
HSO00ILI s C s
PACKAGE 2

TOTAL s s s s
PACKAGE 3:

HSO006AP $ C E
HS0006L6 $ s s
PACKAGE 3

TOTAL s s s s
PACKAGE 13:

HSO0026A/P $ C E
HSO00SLS s C s
PACKAGE 13

TOTAL $ 5 s $
PACKAGE 16:

HSO030AR s s s
HSO0003L3 s s 5 $

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District
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PACKAGE 16

TOTAL S S S S
PACKAGE 23:

CHO006A/P S S S S

CHO0003L3 S S S $

PACKAGE 23

TOTAL s s s s
PACKAGE 27:

CHO011A/P S S S S

CHO0006L6 S S S S

PACKAGE 27

TOTAL s s s )

B 6319”@/ Tow pdrou =

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type)

/- —
1y 10 Voo —>
Company Name

AN\ MoT%an \D[ R NI S e VI N2 FARR]
Company Address and Telephone Number

,ﬁ ‘) oS- af 2009
Authorized Signatur_e__‘// Date
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